
Week 

4

Monday

14 Feb

Tuesday

15 Feb

Wednesday

16 Feb

Thursday

17 Feb

Friday

18 Feb

Sing and dance to ‘Mr 
Clickety Cane’ 
https://www.youtube.com
/watch?v=r8yOGLD4PLU

Draw some of the things 
that Mr Clickety Cane does 
in this song.

Watch the monster video 
again and practice all of the 
sounds and their actions.
https://binged.it/3by2D5i

See how many things you 
can draw that start with the 
‘t’ sound. 

Watch the Gruffalo 
https://www.youtube.com/

watch?v=s8sUPpPc8Ws

Print off the attached 
activity and draw your own 
terrible creature.

Read a story with a grown 
up. Tell the grown up who 
the characters are in the 
story. Which was your 
favourite character? Draw 
the character that you liked 
the best.

Watch the monster video 
again and practice all of the 
sounds and their actions.
https://binged.it/3by2D5i

Count with the Singing 
Walrus all the way to 20
https://www.youtube.com
/watch?v=D0Ajq682yrA
Do you have a balloon? Hit 
the balloon up in the air. 
Count how many times 
you can hit it without it 
touching the ground. What 
is your record? If you don’t 
have a balloon, try 
bouncing a ball as many 
times as you can.

Let’s start with some 
counting
https://www.youtube.com/
watch?v=Aq4UAss33qA
Go for a walk with a grown 
up down your street. How 
may number 5s can you find 
on letterboxes? Does your 
letterbox have a number 5? 
If not, what number/s does 
it have?

See if you can tell Miss 
Patty what the next colour 
in the pattern will be
https://www.youtube.com/
watch?v=PxGEcfyD49U
Take some chalk outside to 
your driveway (if you don’t 
have chalk you can use 
water and a paintbrush or 
just a pen and paper) have 
a go at writing all the 
numbers you know.

Grover is playing with some 
tall monsters today
https://www.youtube.com
/watch?v=oqWvhs4uzPc
Who is the tallest person in 
your family? Draw your 
family from the shortest to 
the tallest.
This is a pretty funny video 
about tall and short 
https://www.youtube.com
/watch?v=s8-uuMy7NvE

Make some shapes with 
Jack Hartman
https://www.youtube.com
/watch?v=QaF84YHNQNg
Now go outside and go for 
a shape hunt. Today you 
are looking for rectangles 
and ovals. Can you find any 
in your back yard? What 
other shapes can you find?

Go outside and see if you 
can find some living things. 
How many can you find? 
Draw a picture of some 
things that you can find.

Log in and do a guided 
drawing from this link. 
https://www.youtube.com/
c/ArtforKidsHub/videos

Draw a picture of your 
family. If you have any pets, 
make sure you add them in 
too. 

Teach someone in your 
family the milkshake song. 
Don’t forget to follow along 
with the actions. 
https://www.youtube.com
/watch?v=Y9LLfv7yauM

It’s fun Friday! Grab a 
pillow and watch a movie.
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